
Thank you for your interest in Dating Matters®, a 
comprehensive teen dating violence prevention 
model developed by CDC to stop teen dating 
violence before it starts. Dating Matters includes 
programs for 6th and 7th grade youth and their 
parents that provide the knowledge and skills they 
need to prevent teen dating violence and support the 
development of healthy relationships. 

A community access code is required to access 
the Dating Matters 6th and 7th grade parent and 
youth program materials in PDF or print form. 
One representative from each community or 
organization may request a code and distribute it 
to all staff who will need access to the training and 
implementation materials. In order to preserve 
the integrity of the Dating Matters training and 
training materials, the requestor must also agree 
to Terms of Use. The access code will allow your 

implementation team to complete the Program 
Facilitator Training, download all implementation 
materials, and order select materials in print.  

To request a community access code, please visit: 
https://vetoviolence.org/apps/dating-matters-hub/
dating-matters-user-agreement/     

The Dating Matters Toolkit includes all of the 
materials and tools needed to carry out each 
component of the prevention model, including an 
online training for youth and parent facilitators and 
guidance for organizations leading implementation 
in their community.  You can find it at 
https://vetoviolence.cdc.gov/apps/dating-matters
-toolkit!
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